P

vee 43 mee 1093

IN THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE STATE OF OREGON
g - 748 FOR THE COUNTY OF YAMHILL 7
SITTING FOR THE TRANSACTION OF COUNTY BUSINESS

In the Matter of an Ordinance )
to Amend the Yamhill County )
Dog Control Ordinance, Ordi- )
nance 274 as Amended by Ordi- ) ORDINANCE NO. 422
nances 285, 361 and 366, to )
Provide for Increase in Cer- )
tain License Feesg }

THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF YAMHILL COUNTY, OREGON (the
Board)} on the 4th day of December, 1985, sat for the transaction
of County business in regular session, Commissioners Ted Lopus-
zynski, Donald D. Porter and David E. Bishop being present.

WHEREAS, the Yamhill County Dog Control Advisory Board and
the Yamhill County Sheriff have requested an increase in certain
license fees in order to provide adequate licensing revenue for
the dog control program; and

WHEREAS, the Board has determined it to be in the best in-
terests of the citizens of Yamhill County to ensure adequate
funding for the dog control program: NOW THEREFORE

IT IS HEREBY ORDAINED BY THE BOARD as follows:

Section 1. Section 4.2 of the Yamhill County Dog Control
Ordinance is hereby amended as follows:

(i) Section 4.2(a) is amended by deleting "$6.00" and
inserting "$7.00".

(ii) Section 4.2(b) is amended by deleting "$3.00" and
inserting "$4.00".

(iii) Section 4.2(e) is amended by deleting "12.00" and
ingerting "$13.00".

Section 2. This ordinance being necessary for the health,
safety and welfare of the citizens of Yamhill County and an
emergency having been declared shall be effective on the first day
of January, 1986.

NOW THEREFORE, after public hearing and reading on the 20th
day of November, 1985, and the 4th day of December, 1985, before
the Yamhill County Board of Commissioners, and an emergency having
been declared to exist, upon motion duly made and regularly passed,
this ordinance was adopted on December 4, 1985.

P By

ATTEST: < g@Mﬁ{g YAMHILL COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
S
'S - 7 LZ}%?'
CHARLES | §T¥% yrza oz fgiat
County c%? ] Chairman (/' TED/LOPUSZYNSKI
;.qé .
’7‘

Deputy'bLA“fﬁnp

%@a@m 7

Commissioner .DONALD‘DIPPORTER

DARY, S}éGARRETTSON Commissioner  DAVID E. BI1GHOP
i1l Lounty Counsel

ORDINANCE 422



