20tH

FOR THE COUNTY OF YAMHILL

In the Matter of an Amendment
to the Yamhill County Dog Con-
trol Ordinance, No. 274, as
Amended by Ordinance No. 285,
to Increase License Fees

ORDINANCE NO. 361

THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF YAMHILL COUNTY, OREGON (the Board),
on the 9th day of November, 1983, sat for the transaction of County
business, in special session, Commissioners Dave Bishop and Ted
Lopuszynski being present.

WHEREAS, on August 26, 1981, the Yamhill County Board of Commis-
sioners adopted Ordinance No. 274, known as the Yamhiill County Dog
Control Ordinance, said Ordinance being amended November 4, 1981, by
Ordinance 285; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners of Yamhill County, after con-
ducting a publice hearing on the 9th day of November, 1983, has deter-
mined that it is necessary to amend the Yamhill County Dog Control
Ordinance to increase license fees; and

WHEREAS, it is in the best interests of the citizens of Yamhill
County to make changes in the area of fees; NOW THEREFORE,

IT IS HEREBY ORDAINED BY THE YAMHILL COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 4.2 of the Yamhill County Dog Ordinance is
hereby amended as follows:

(i} Section 4.2{(a) is amended by deleting "$5,00"
and replacing said deletion with "$6.00."

(i1} Section 4.2(¢) 1is hereby amended by deleting
"$3.00" and replacing said deletion with "$5,00."

(iii) Section 4.2(e) is hereby amended by deleting
"$11.00" and replacing said deletion with "$12.,00."

Section 2., This Ordinance being necessary for the health, safety
and welfare of the citizens of Yamhill County, and an emergency having

been declared, shall be effective upon passage hereof,

DONE this 9th day of November, 1983, at McMinnville, Oregon.

Lk

"1

ATTEST: YAMHILL COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
Commissioner DAVE BISHOP

,72: % /.

Commissioner s T%B7LOPUSZYNSKI

APPROVED AS T Fj?f;@qqg;%
By: /;Zrux» J

JOHRNY. GRAY, Jﬁié:
Assistynt County ungel

B T o CHARLES STERN
SITTING FOR THE TRANSACTION OF COUNTY BUSINESS COUNTY CLERK
Phts AR Y



